
GOVERNMENT OF TI.IE PUNJAB
TRANSPORT T'EPARTMENT

-.,\ J+Lf trv April, 202I

NOTIFICATIO

No. SO(P-I)Z-L/2OL7 (RPBW).- In exercise of the powers conferred under Section 43

and 69 of the Provincial Motor Vehicles Ordinance, 1965 (XIX of 1965) and after previous

publication, Governor of the Punjab is pleased to make the following amendments in the Punjab

Motor Vehicles Rules, 1969 with immediate effect.

AMENDMENTS

Punjab Motor Vehicles Rules, 1969:

In Rule 64, in sub-rule (2), for the words "four hundred and fifty", the words "six
hundred and fifty" shall be substituted.

In Rule 77, for sub-rule (1), the following shall be substituted:

"(1) Fee for grant and renewal of route permits shall be as under:

In the

(1)

(2)

B,

Application Fee for Route Permit (Grant / Renewal):

A, Passenger vehicles (for one year):

c. Goods Vehicles (public I private carriers) (for three years):

Description Fee
A-CIass Routes Rs.1400/-
B-Class Routes Rs.1 100/-

( i) M-Class Routes Rs.2000/-

Motor Cab Taxi (for one year):
..rl

Description Fee
( ) for 1st District Rs.B50/-
i) For each Remalning District Rs.100/-

Description Fee
i) For 1't District Rs.2550/-
ii) For each remainlnq District Rs.200/-

Deqgrpligl
Within the jurisdictional limits of respective
District Reglonal Transport Authority on

Rs.600/-

D, Motor Cycle rickshaw (for one year):



I

J

#

\'t k

Motor Cab rickshaw (for one year):

F. M iscellaneous Amendments

Description Fee
Late fee for renewal of Route Permit Rs.300/-
Transfer fee of Route Permit Rs.600/-'
Duplicate fee of Route Permit Rs.500/-'
Hearing fee for Transport appeals Rs.500/-"
Fee for issuance of attested copies of
orders ldocuments regarding transpott
appeal

Rs.100/-'

in Rule 85, in sub-rule (2), for the words "two hundred", the words "three hundred"
shall be substituted.

In Rule 92, in sub-rule (1), for the words "four hundred", the words "six hundred" shall
be substituted.

In Rule 93, in sub-rule (5), for the words "Wvo hundred" and "one hundred", the words
"three hundred" and "two hundred" shall be substituted respectively.

In Rule 97:

(a) in sub-rule (2) for the words "two hundred", the words "five hundred" shall be

substituted; and

(b) in sub-rule (4), for the words "twenty rupees". the words "one hundred" shall be

substituted.

SECRETARY
GOVERNMENT OF THE PUNJAB

TRANSPORT DEPARTMENT

NO. & DATE EVEN

A copy is forwarded for information to the:

1. The Principal Secretary to Governor, Punjab.

2. The Principal Secretary to Chief Minister, Punjab.

3. All Divisional Commissioners in Punjab.

4. All Deputy Commissioners/Chairman DRTAs in Punjab.

5. The Secretary, Provincial Transport Authority Punjab, Lahore.

6. The Deputy Secretary (Staff) to the Chief Secretary, Punjab.

7. All Secretaries DRTAs in Punjab"

L The Chief Executive Officer, Lahore Transport Company.

9. PS to Secretary Transport.

E.

(3)

(4)

(s)

(6)

,l,l*,,
sEcTroN OFFICER (PLANNING-l)


